
INSTITUTIONAL DISTINCTIVENSSS

 

The institution strongly believes in the concept of transformational education to empower the 
learners. The vision to train learners for a varied skilled roles and professions is realised through 
various  courses  and  programmes.  Efforts  are  also  directed  to  cater  to  the  diverse  needs  of 
students coming from varied socio-economic backgrounds. For instance, Under Graduate B.A. 
programme is also offered in Telugu. B. Com Honours and B.A. Honours in Political Science 
are  offered  for  the  students  who  are  keen  to  pursue  graduation  with  higher  degree  of 
achievement and in-depth understanding of various courses.  

These  programmes  inculcate  a  spirit  of  scientific  inquiry,  inspire  independent  and  critical 
thinking,  and  develop  analytical,  research  and  experimental  abilities.  Efforts  are  made  to 
develop self-reliance and entrepreneurship qualities to seek appropriate employment and also 
generate self-employment 

The different curricular and extracurricular activities provide a strong platform to the learners 
to  become  socially  responsible  and  committed  to  the  community  orientation.  As  part  of 
curriculum deliver, experts from different fields are invited to deliver lectures to enhance their 
knowledge and awareness about various social and environmental issues. 

The various Post Graduate programmes help in not only acquiring theoretical knowledge but 
also developing research skills and orientation in their respective fields. The Add on courses 
are need-based and they are designed in consonance with the requirements of various private 
and  public  sector  organizations.  For  instance, certificate course  like English  Language 
Proficiency  Course  (primary  and  advance  levels),  Certificate  and  Diploma  programmes  in 
Family and Marriage Counselling; Diploma in Child Psychology opens several avenues for the 
students not only  in terms of utilising  the knowledge in their personal space but also seek 
employment in these related professions. 

As the mission of the institution is to focus on life sustaining skills of the learners, the various 
core programmes and courses indeed fulfil this goal. The activities and programmes by the 
different cells and committees of the college (with focus on issues like environment, gender, 
health,) supplement the course delivery to strengthen various skill set. These activities also are 
significant sources of providing much needed exposure to the grass root realities of society. 
This facilitates in developing realistic attitudes towards life and society. 

Most significantly the purpose of establishment of this institution has been to provide quality 
education to women from all walks of life including rural, tribal and urban. The institution from 
the day of its inception has made sincere and concrete efforts to fulfil this goal. As is witnessed 
in  the  evolution  of  this  institution  (from  being  an  autonomous  college  to  first  Women 
University of Telangana) in terms of its curriculum, teaching learning practices, research and 
extension  activities,  infrastructure  and  learning  resources,  student  support,  governance  and 
benchmarking institutional practices- every effort has its own unique distinction all 
culminating in the service of the nation and society  
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